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Informed consent form 

I, the undersigned <Insert name of the applicant here>, declare: 

 I am 18 years or older and I am competent to provide consent; 

 I have read the Information sheet providing information about the competition “ImPossible 
Design 2021”, this Informed consent form, and the accompanying Declaration of honour. I have 
had the opportunity to ask questions about the contents of these documents, and all my 
questions have been answered to my satisfaction, so I understand completely the information 
provided in the Information sheet, the Informed consent form and the Declaration of honour; 

 I have been properly informed about the concept, the aims and purposes of the competition 
“ImPossible Design”; I understand that there is no compulsion to participate in the competition 
and, if I choose to participate, I may withdraw my participation at any stage; 

 I understand that the competition “ImPossible Design 2021” is an activity of the project 
A_MADAM (“Advanced design for optimal dynamic properties of additive manufacturing 
products”); 

 I understand the basic content and goals of the A_MADAM project, the Marie Curie-Sklodowska 
action and the Horizon 2020 programme; 

 I understand the conditions for participation in the competition, explained in the Information 
sheet; I confirm that I fulfil all the requirements expressed in the document; 

 I understand the application procedure for the competition “ImPossible Design 2021”. In 
particular, I understand that I will provide my name and an e-mail address for the purposes of 
communication with the organizers of the competition and verification of identity of the 
winners of the competition; 

 I understand that the winners of the competition will have to provide their personal identity 
number during the process of verification of the identity; 

 I understand that any personal data I provide will be treated as confidential and will not be 
disclosed unless I am awarded a prize; 

 I agree that my name may be disclosed if I am awarded a prize, unless I make a written opposite 
request to the organizers of the competition during the process of verification of my identity; 

 I agree that my personal data may be disclosed without my consent if a claim arises that I have 
violated intellectual property rights with my application, but in that case I have to be informed 
about the claim and the disclosure; 

 I freely and voluntarily apply to participate in the competition “ImPossible Design 2021”, though 
without prejudice to my legal and ethical rights, and I accept all the rules of competition; 

This consent form is made pursuant to the relevant national, European and international data 
protection laws and regulations and personal data treatment obligations. Specifically this consent 
document complies with the following laws and regulations: 

 EC Data Protection Directive 95/46/EC of the European Parliament and of the Council of 24 
October 1995 on the protection of individuals with regard to the processing of personal  data and 
on the free movement of such data. 

_________________ ____________________ 
 (Signature) (Place, date) 


